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Series B Redeemable Preferred Stock

Indicate by check mark if the registrant is a well-known seasoned issuer, as defined in Rule 405 of the Securities
Act.  YES o     NO þ

Indicate by check mark if the registrant is not required to file reports pursuant to Section 13 or Section 15(d) of the
Act.  YES o     NO þ

Indicate by check mark whether the registrant (1) has filed all reports required to be filed by Section 13 or 15(d) of the
Securities Exchange Act of 1934 during the preceding 12 months (or for such shorter period that the registrant was
required to file such reports), and (2) has been subject to such filing requirements for the past 90 days.  YES þ     NO o

Indicate by check mark whether the registrant has submitted electronically and posted on its corporate Web site, if
any, every Interactive Data File required to be submitted and posted pursuant to Rule 405 of Regulation S-T during
the preceding 12 months (or for such shorter period that the registrant was required to submit and post such
files).  YES o     NO o

Indicate by check mark if the disclosure of delinquent filers pursuant to Item 405 of Regulation S-K is not contained
herein, and will not be contained, to the best of registrant�s knowledge, in, definitive proxy or information statements
incorporated by reference in part III of this Form 10-K or any amendment to this form 10-K.  þ

Indicate by check mark whether the registrant is a large accelerated filer, an accelerated filer, a non-accelerated filer,
or a smaller reporting company. See the definitions of �large accelerated filer,� �accelerated filer� and �smaller reporting
company� in Rule 12b-2 of the Exchange Act. (Check one):

Large accelerated filer o Accelerated filer o Non-accelerated filer o
(Do not check if a smaller reporting company)

Smaller reporting company þ

Indicate by check mark whether the registrant is a shell company (as defined in Rule 12b-2 of the Exchange
Act).  YES o     NO þ

The aggregate market value of the Common Stock, held by non-affiliates of the registrant as of June 30, 2009, the last
business day of the registrant�s most recently completed second fiscal quarter, based on the closing price of $13.91 per
share on the NYSE Amex, was $7,022,000.

1,525,166 shares of Common Stock were outstanding at March 26, 2010.

DOCUMENTS INCORPORATED BY REFERENCE

The information called for by Part III is incorporated by reference to the definitive Proxy Statement for the Annual
Meeting of Stockholders of the Company.
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PART I

Item 1. Business

The Hallwood Group Incorporated (�Hallwood� or the �Company�) (NYSE Amex: HWG), a Delaware corporation
formed in September 1981, operates as a holding company. The principal remaining business is in the textile products
industry, following the bankruptcy reorganization in 2009 of its former affiliate, Hallwood Energy, L.P. (�Hallwood
Energy�).

Textile Products.  Textile products operations are conducted through the Company�s wholly owned subsidiary,
Brookwood Companies Incorporated (�Brookwood�). Brookwood is an integrated textile firm that develops and
produces innovative fabrics and related products through specialized finishing, treating and coating processes.

Organization.  Brookwood principally operates as a converter, finisher and laminator in the textile industry, which
processes fabrics at its plants, located in Rhode Island and Connecticut, or by contracting with independent finishers.
Brookwood is one of the largest coaters of woven nylons in the United States of America. Brookwood is known for its
extensive, in-house expertise in high-tech fabric development and is a major supplier of specialty fabric to
U.S. military contractors. Brookwood produces fabrics that meet standards and specifications set by both government
and private industry, which are used by military, consumer and industrial customers. Brookwood has two subsidiaries
at December 31, 2009:

� Kenyon Industries, Inc. (�Kenyon�).  Kenyon, located in Rhode Island, uses the latest technologies and processes
in dyeing, finishing, coating and printing of woven synthetic products. Kenyon provides quality finishing
services for fabrics used in a variety of markets, such as military, luggage and knapsacks, flag and banner,
apparel, industrial and sailcloth.

� Brookwood Laminating, Inc. (�Brookwood Laminating�).  Brookwood Laminating, located in Connecticut, uses
the latest in processing technology to provide quality laminating services for fabrics used in military clothing
and equipment, sailcloth, medical equipment, industrial applications and consumer apparel. Up to five layers of
textile materials can be processed using both wet and dry lamination techniques.

Raw Materials and Suppliers.  The principal raw materials used by Brookwood include various untreated woven
nylons, other fabrics, films, dyes and chemical compounds acquired primarily from U.S. suppliers.

Brookwood generally maintains relationships with a limited number of suppliers, however, Brookwood believes that
these raw materials are available from alternative suppliers if a supplier cannot meet Brookwood�s requirements.
Brookwood�s significant suppliers include General Electric, Milliken & Company, Precision Fabrics Group, Inc., and
Schneider Mills, Inc.

Sales and Distribution.  Brookwood�s products are sold through its internal sales force in New York, Connecticut and
California and a minimal network of independent sales representatives.

Substantially all products are sold to U.S. organizations, including various customers holding or participating in
military contracts.

Competition.  The textile market remains highly competitive. Competition is principally based on product
development, design, price, quality and service. Brookwood�s ability to compete is enhanced by its in-house expertise
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and vertical integration of its product development, converting, finishing and laminating process.

Brookwood�s competitive position varies by product line. There are several major domestic competitors in the
synthetic fabrics business, none of which dominates the market. Brookwood believes, however, that it has a strong
competitive position. In addition, Brookwood believes it is one of a few finishers successful in printing camouflage on
nylon for sale to apparel suppliers of the U.S. government. Additional competitive strengths of Brookwood include:
knowledge of its customers� business needs; its ability to design and produce special fabrics such as textured blends;
waterproof breathable fabrics; state of the art fabric finishing equipment at its facilities; substantial vertical
integration; and its ability to communicate electronically with its customers.

Seasonality and Backlog.  The textile industry historically experiences cyclical swings. Brookwood has partially offset
the effect of those swings by diversifying its product lines and business base. Brookwood has
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historically enjoyed a fairly steady base level stream of orders that comprise its backlog. However, the backlog is
subject to market conditions and the timing of contracts granted to its prime government contractor customers.
Management believes that Brookwood maintains a level of inventory adequate to leverage its sales requirements and
has historically enjoyed a consistent to improving turnover ratio.

Patents.  In January 2003, Brookwood was granted a patent, which expires in September 2019, for its ��breathable,
waterproof laminate and method for making same�. Brookwood has ongoing programs of research and development in
all of its divisions adequate to maintain the exploration, development and production of innovative products and
technologies.

For the three years ended December 31, 2009, textile products operations accounted for all of the Company�s operating
revenues. For details regarding revenue, profit and total assets, see Note 17 to the Company�s consolidated financial
statements.

Energy.  During the three years ended December 31, 2009, the Company�s investment in the energy segment was
conducted through Hallwood Energy. The Company accounted for the investment in Hallwood Energy using the
equity method of accounting, recording its pro rata share of Hallwood Energy�s net income (loss), partners� capital
transactions and comprehensive income (loss), as appropriate.

Hallwood Energy was a privately held independent oil and gas limited partnership and operated as an upstream energy
company engaged in the acquisition, development, exploration, production, and sale of hydrocarbons, with a primary
focus on natural gas assets.

Bankruptcy Reorganization by Hallwood Energy.  On March 1, 2009, Hallwood Energy, L.P., Hallwood Energy
Management, LLC (the general partner of Hallwood Energy, �HEM�), and Hallwood Energy�s subsidiaries, filed
petitions for relief under Chapter 11 of the United States Bankruptcy Code. The cases were adjudicated in the United
States Bankruptcy Court for the Northern District of Texas, Dallas Division, in In re Hallwood Energy, L.P., etal Case
No. 09-31253. The Company was only an investor in and creditor of Hallwood Energy. The bankruptcy filing did not
include the Company or any other of its assets.

On June 29, 2009, the Bankruptcy Court granted a motion by Hall Phoenix/Inwood, Ltd. (�HPI�), the secured lender to
Hallwood Energy, to partially lift the automatic stay applicable in bankruptcy proceedings, permitting HPI, among
other things, to enter upon and take possession of substantially all of Hallwood Energy�s assets and operations.

On October 16, 2009, the Bankruptcy Court confirmed a plan of reorganization of the debtors that, among other
things, extinguished Hallwood Energy�s general partnership and limited partnership interests, including those held by
the Company. In addition, Hallwood Energy�s convertible notes, including those held by the Company, are
subordinated to recovery in favor of HPI. As a result of these developments, the Company does not anticipate that it
will recover any of its investments in Hallwood Energy. The carrying value of the Company�s investment in Hallwood
Energy has been reflected as zero since December 31, 2007.

In connection with Hallwood Energy�s bankruptcy proceeding, Hallwood Energy and other parties have filed lawsuits
and threatened to assert additional claims against the Company and certain related parties alleging actual,
compensatory and exemplary damages in excess of $200,000,000, based on purported breach of contract, fraud,
breach of fiduciary duties, neglect, negligence and various misleading statements, omissions and misrepresentations.
See Item 3. Legal Proceedings of this report. The Company believes that the allegations and claims are without merit
and intends to defend the lawsuits and any future claims vigorously.
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Refer also to Item 7, �Management�s Discussion and Analysis of Financial Condition and Results of Operations �
Investments in Hallwood Energy� for a further discussion of the Company�s former energy activities, including the
bankruptcy case.

Segment and Related Information.  For details regarding revenue, profit (loss) and total assets, see Note 17 to the
Company�s consolidated financial statements.
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Number of Employees

The Company and its wholly owned Brookwood subsidiary had 478 and 460 employees as of February 28, 2010 and
2009, respectively, comprised as follows:

February 28,
2010 2009

Hallwood 7 7
Brookwood 471 453

Total 478 460

On February 28, 2010, Kenyon reached agreement for a new three-year collective bargaining agreement with Local
1321T of the New England Joint Board of UNITE HERE! union, representing approximately 250 employees at its
Rhode Island plant facility, effective from March 1, 2010 through February 28, 2013. The agreement was ratified by
the union on March 1, 2010 and is currently awaiting signature.

Available Information

The Company�s Annual Report on Form 10-K, Quarterly Reports on Form 10-Q, Current Reports on Form 8-K and
amendments to reports filed pursuant to Sections 13(a) and 15(d) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, as amended
(the ��Exchange Act�), are available on its website at www.hallwood.com, as soon as reasonably practicable after such
reports are electronically filed with the Securities and Exchange Commission (�SEC�). Additionally, the Company�s
Code of Business Conduct and Ethics, Whistle Blower Policy and Audit Committee Charter may be accessed through
the website. The Company�s website and the information contained therein or connected thereto shall not be deemed to
be incorporated into this Annual Report.

Executive Officers of the Company

In addition to Anthony J. Gumbiner, age 65, who serves as Director, Chairman and Chief Executive Officer of the
Company (see Item 10) , the following individuals also serve as executive officers:

William L. Guzzetti, age 66, has served as President and Chief Operating Officer of the Company since March 2005
and as Executive Vice President from October 1989 to March 2005. He also served as President, Chief Operating
Officer and a Director of Hallwood Energy and each of the former energy affiliates from their inception until June
2009. Mr. Guzzetti had served as President, Chief Operating Officer and a Director of Hallwood Energy Corporation,
formerly based in Denver, Colorado and sold in May 2001, from December 1998 until May 2001 and of its
predecessors since 1985. From 1990 until its sale in 2004, Mr. Guzzetti served as President, Chief Operating Officer
and a Director of Hallwood Realty, LLC (�Hallwood Realty�) and Hallwood Commercial Real Estate (�HCRE�),
respectively. He had served as the President and a director of Hallwood Energy Corporation (�HEC�), formerly based in
Cleburne, Texas and sold in December 2004, from December 2002 until December 2004. He is a member of the
Florida Bar and the State Bar of Texas.

Richard Kelley, age 49, assumed the positions of Vice President, Chief Financial Officer and Secretary of the
Company, in December 2008. Mr. Kelley has been with the Company, or one of the Company�s affiliates, since 1985.
Prior to his appointment, Mr. Kelley has served as the Company�s Director of Human Resources since July 2004. He
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served as the Manager of Financial & SEC Reporting for Hallwood Realty from May 1990 to July 2004. Mr. Kelley
served as the Financial Reporting Accountant from June 1985 to March 1987 and as the Manager of Financial & SEC
Reporting from March 1987 to May 1990 for Hallwood Energy Corporation.

Amber M. Brookman, age 67, has served as President, Chief Executive Officer and a Director of Brookwood since
1989. From July 2004 to April 2007, Ms. Brookman served as a director of Syms Corporation, a national clothing
retailer with headquarters in Secaucus, New Jersey.
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Item 1A. Risk Factors

Risks related to the Company

A significant stockholder has the ability to substantially influence the Company and it may conflict with or differ from
other stockholders.  Hallwood Financial Limited (�Hallwood Financial�), a corporation controlled by the Company�s
chairman and chief executive officer, Mr. Anthony J. Gumbiner and members of his family, owns approximately 66%
of the Company�s outstanding common stock as of March 29, 2010. Accordingly, Mr. Gumbiner can exert substantial
influence over the affairs of the Company.

The Company�s success is dependent upon retaining key management personnel whose continued service is not
guaranteed.  The Company is dependent upon its executive officers for strategic business direction and specialized
industry experience. While the Company believes that it could find replacements for these key personnel, loss of their
services could adversely affect the Company�s operations.

Brookwood�s ability to pay cash dividends and tax sharing payments to the Company are contingent upon Brookwood�s
compliance with loan covenants required by its revolving credit agreement.  Cash dividends and tax sharing payments
by Brookwood to the Company are contingent upon compliance with the loan covenants in Brookwood�s Working
Capital Revolving Credit Facility with Key Bank National Association. This limitation on the transferability of assets
could adversely affect the Company�s operations if such payments were restricted.

Compliance with corporate governance and disclosure standards is costly.  The Company has spent and continues to
spend a significant amount of management time and resources to comply with laws, regulations and standards relating
to corporate governance and public disclosure, including under the Sarbanes-Oxley Act of 2002 (�Sarbanes-Oxley�),
SEC regulations and stock exchange rules. Section 404 of Sarbanes-Oxley requires management�s annual review and
evaluation of the Company�s internal control over financial reporting and attestations of the effectiveness of these
controls by management. Because the Company qualifies as a smaller reporting company, the Company�s independent
registered public accounting firm is not required to provide an attestation report. In early 2008, the Company
completed its first Section 404 report for the year ended December 31, 2007. The Company continued to enhance its
internal controls and completed its annual review and evaluation of its internal controls and issued its Section 404
report for the years ended December 31, 2008 and 2009 in April 2009 and March 2010, respectively. However, there
is no guarantee that the Company will receive management assurance or an attestation by our independent registered
public accounting firm that internal control over financial reporting is effective in future periods. In the event that the
Company�s chief executive officer, chief financial officer or independent registered public accounting firm determines
that the Company�s internal control over financial reporting is not effective as required by Section 404 of
Sarbanes-Oxley, investor perceptions of the Company may be adversely affected. In addition, overhead may increase
as a result of the additional costs associated with complying with the complex legal requirements associated with
being a public reporting company.

Litigation may adversely affect the Company�s financial condition, results of operations and cash flows.  The
Company and its subsidiaries are involved in a number of litigation matters, as described in Item 3. Legal Proceedings
of this report. Although the Company does not believe that the results of any of these matters are likely to have a
material adverse effect on its financial condition, results of operations or cash flows, it is possible that any of the
matters could result in material liability to the Company. In addition, the Company has spent and will likely continue
to spend significant amounts in professional fees in connection with these matters.

Risks related to our Textile Products Business
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The Company�s textile products business may be affected by the following risk factors, each of which could adversely
affect the Company.

Brookwood depends upon a limited number of third-party suppliers for raw materials.  Brookwood purchases a
significant amount of the fabric and other materials it processes and sells from a small number of suppliers.
Brookwood believes that the loss of any one of its suppliers would not have a long-term material adverse effect
because other manufacturers with which Brookwood conducts business would be able to fulfill those requirements.
However, the loss of certain of Brookwood�s suppliers could, in the short term, adversely affect Brookwood�s business
until alternative supply arrangements were secured. In addition, there can be no assurance that any new
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supply arrangements would have terms as favorable as those contained in current supply arrangements. Some of
Brookwood�s suppliers are entering the military markets in competition to Brookwood, targeting specific military
specifications, however, there has been no material effect upon Brookwood�s business relationship to date. Brookwood
is monitoring its suppliers and any effect the current economic conditions may have upon their ability to deliver
required materials in a timely manner. The financial markets� inability to determine the extent and longevity of the
current economic downturn may have an effect upon key and multiple suppliers which cannot be determined at this
time. As of March 31, 2010, Brookwood has not experienced any significant disruptions in supply as a result of
shortages in fabrics or other materials from its suppliers.

The loss of one or more of Brookwood�s key customers could result in a significant loss of revenues.  Brookwood has
several customers who accounted for more than 10% of Brookwood�s sales in one or more of the three years ended
December 31, 2009. Sales to one Brookwood customer, Tennier Industries, Inc. (�Tennier�), accounted for more than
10% of Brookwood�s sales in each of the three years ended December 31, 2009. Brookwood�s relationship with Tennier
is ongoing. Sales to Tennier, which are included in military sales, were $60,994,000, $47,310,000 and $40,844,000 in
2009, 2008 and 2007, respectively, which represented 34.0%, 29.2% and 30.8% of Brookwood�s sales. Sales to
another customer, ORC Industries, Inc. (�ORC�), accounted for more than 10% of Brookwood�s sales in 2009 and 2008.
Brookwood�s relationship with ORC is ongoing. Sales to ORC, which are also included in military sales, were
$24,598,000, $18,436,000 and $8,971,000 in 2009, 2008 and 2007, respectively, which represented 13.7%, 11.4% and
6.8% of Brookwood�s sales. Sales to another customer accounted for slightly more than 10% of sales for 2008 only.
Brookwood�s relationship with the customer is ongoing. Sales to that customer, which are also included in military
sales, were $16,752,000 in 2008, which represented 10.3% of Brookwood�s sales.

Military sales were $130,103,000, $101,813,000 and $70,006,000 in 2009, 2008 and 2007, respectively, which
represented 72.5%, 62.8% and 52.8% of Brookwood�s sales. While Brookwood has enjoyed substantial growth in its
military business, there is no assurance this trend will continue. Brookwood�s sales to the customers from whom it
derives its military business have been volatile and difficult to predict, a trend the Company believes will continue. In
recent years, orders from the military for goods generally were significantly affected by the increased activity of the
U.S. military. If this activity does not continue or declines, then orders from the military generally, including orders
for Brookwood�s products, may be similarly affected.

Changes in military procurement practices or regulations could adversely effect Brookwood�s business.  From time to
time, the military limits orders for existing products and adopts revised specifications for new products to replace the
products for which Brookwood�s customers have been suppliers. The U.S. government released orders in recent years
that include Brookwood�s products, which resulted in a substantial increase in military sales over prior periods.
Changes in specifications or orders present a potential opportunity for additional sales; however, it is a continuing
challenge to adjust to changing specifications and production requirements. Brookwood has regularly conducted
research and development on various processes and products intended to comply with the revised specifications and
participates in the bidding process for new military products. However, to the extent Brookwood�s products are not
included in future purchases by the U.S. government for any reason, Brookwood�s sales could be adversely affected. A
provision of U.S. federal law, known as the Berry Amendment, generally requires the Department of Defense to give
preference in procurement to domestically produced products, including textiles. Brookwood�s sales of products to the
U.S. military market is highly dependent upon the continuing application and enforcement of the Berry Amendment
by the U.S. government. In addition, the U.S. government is releasing contracts for shorter periods than in the past.
The Company acknowledges the unpredictability in revenues and margins due to military sales and is unable at this
time to predict future sales trends.

Global capital and credit market conditions could have a material adverse effect on Brookwood�s business, operating
results and financial condition.  The financial instruments that potentially subject Brookwood to concentration of
credit risk consist principally of accounts receivable. Brookwood grants credit to customers based on an evaluation of
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the customer�s financial condition. Exposure to losses on receivables is principally dependent on each customer�s
financial condition. Brookwood manages its exposure to credit risks through credit approvals, credit limits, monitoring
procedures and the use of factors. Brookwood continues to monitor its customers and the effect the current economic
conditions may have upon their ability to fulfill their obligations to Brookwood in a timely manner. As of March 31,
2010, Brookwood�s key customers were complying with their payment terms.
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The amount of receivables that Brookwood can factor is subject to certain limitations as specified in individual
factoring agreements. The factoring agreements expose Brookwood to credit risk if any of the factors fail to meet their
obligations. Brookwood seeks to manage this risk by conducting business with a number of reputable factors and
monitoring the factors� performance under their agreements. Brookwood continues to monitor its factors and the effect
the current economic conditions may have upon their ability to fulfill their obligations to Brookwood in a timely
manner. The parent company of one of Brookwood�s factors, CIT Group Inc. (�CIT�), previously announced it had
liquidity issues and filed for bankruptcy on October 31, 2009. Brookwood took steps to protect its interests with CIT
and expanded its relationships with other factors. Additionally, Brookwood has amended its factor agreement with
CIT that, among other things, allows CIT to be a Brookwood receivables management agent in connection with
post-September 30, 2009 receivables and further clarifies Brookwood�s ownership of the receivables. As of March 31,
2010, all of Brookwood�s factors were complying with payment terms in accordance with factor agreements, although
such terms from the other factors have resulted in timing differences that have increased Brookwood�s end-of-month
receivables balances.

Brookwood�s ability to comply with its revolving credit agreement is subject to future performance and other
factors.  Brookwood�s revolving credit agreement requires compliance with various loan covenants and financial
ratios, principally a total debt to tangible net worth ratio of 1.50, a requirement that net income in each quarter must
exceed one dollar and a new covenant, effective December 31, 2009, of total funded debt to EBITDA (earnings before
interest, taxes, depreciation and amortization), for the trailing four quarters, ratio not to exceed 2.00. Brookwood was
in compliance with its principal loan covenants as of December 31, 2009, 2008 and 2007 and for all interim periods
during those years, although a waiver regarding a pro forma (inclusive of projected dividend) total debt to tangible net
worth ratio for the 2007 third quarter was granted to allow a $1,500,000 dividend payment in November 2007 and an
amendment to the revolving credit agreement was entered into in June 2008 to allow a $4,800,000 dividend payment
in June 2008 and restrict calendar 2008 total dividends from Brookwood to $9,300,000.

Brookwood is subject to many environmental regulations that may result in significant costs or liabilities or cause
interruptions in its operations.  Kenyon and Brookwood Laminating are subject to a broad range of federal, state and
local laws and regulations relating to the pollution and protection of the environment. Among the many environmental
requirements applicable to Kenyon and Brookwood Laminating are laws relating to air emissions, ozone depletion,
wastewater discharges and the handling, disposal and release of solid and hazardous substances and wastes. Based on
continuing internal review and advice from independent consultants, Kenyon and Brookwood Laminating believe that
they are currently in substantial compliance with applicable environmental requirements. Kenyon and Brookwood
Laminating are also subject to such laws as the Comprehensive Environmental Response Compensation and Liability
Act (��CERCLA�), that may impose liability retroactively and without fault for releases or threatened releases of
hazardous substances at on-site or off-site locations. Kenyon and Brookwood Laminating are not aware of any
releases for which they may be liable under CERCLA or any analogous provision. Actions by federal, state and local
governments concerning environmental matters could result in laws or regulations that could increase the cost of
producing the products manufactured by Kenyon and Brookwood Laminating or otherwise adversely affect demand
for their products. Widespread adoption of any prohibitions or restrictions could adversely affect the cost and/or the
ability to produce products and thereby have a material adverse effect upon Kenyon, Brookwood Laminating or
Brookwood.

Brookwood does not currently anticipate any material adverse effect on its business, results of operations, financial
condition or competitive position as a result of its efforts to comply with environmental requirements. Some risk of
environmental liability is inherent, however, in the nature of Brookwood�s business. There can be no assurance that
material environmental liabilities will not arise. It is also possible that future developments in environmental
regulation could lead to material environmental compliance or cleanup costs.
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Brookwood�s business could lose a significant competitive advantage if it fails to adequately protect its intellectual
property rights.  Brookwood considers its patents and trademarks, in the aggregate, to be important to its business and
seeks to protect this proprietary know-how in part through U.S. patent and trademark registrations. No assurance can
be given, however, that such protection will give Brookwood any material competitive advantage. In addition,
Brookwood maintains certain trade secrets for which, in order to maintain the confidentiality of such trade secrets, it
has not sought patent or trademark protection. As a result, such trade secrets could be infringed upon
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and such infringement could have a material adverse effect on its business, results of operations, financial condition or
competitive position.

In July 2007, Nextec Applications Inc. filed a lawsuit in the United States District Court for the Southern District of
New York claiming that Brookwood infringed five United States patents pertaining to internally-coated webs. Nextec
sought leave of Court to add two additional patents to the lawsuit. The Court conducted a hearing on February 17,
2010 to hear argument on motions for summary judgment filed by both parties on various issues and defenses. No
ruling has yet been issued following the hearing. Brookwood intends to vigorously defend against these claims. Refer
to Item 3. Legal Proceedings in this report for a further description of this lawsuit.

The strength of Brookwood�s competitors may impact its ability to maintain and grow sales, which could decrease
revenues.  The cyclical nature of the textile and apparel industries, characterized by rapid shifts in military
procurement, fashion and consumer demand and competitive pressures, results in both price and demand volatility.
The demand for any particular product varies from time to time based largely upon changes in military specifications,
consumer and industrial preferences, and general economic conditions affecting the textile and apparel industries, such
as consumer expenditures for non-durable goods. The textile and apparel industries are also cyclical because the
supply of particular products changes as competitors enter or leave the market.

Brookwood sells primarily to domestic manufacturers, some of which operate offshore sewing operations. Some of
Brookwood�s customers have moved their business offshore. Brookwood has responded by shipping fabric Asia to
Asia and also by supplying finished products and garments directly to manufacturers. Brookwood competes with
numerous domestic and foreign fabric manufacturers, including companies larger in size and having greater financial
resources than Brookwood. The principal competitive factors in the woven fabrics markets are price, service, delivery
time, quality and flexibility, with the relative importance of each factor depending upon the needs of particular
customers and the specific product offering. Brookwood�s management believes that Brookwood maintains its ability
to compete effectively by providing its customers with a broad array of high-quality fabrics at competitive prices on a
timely basis.

There are an increasing number of competitors entering the military market. These competitors vary and include
converters from other market segments, as well as major mills, some of which are Brookwood suppliers, who are
selectively targeting specific military specifications. As these companies enter the military market, the competitive
pressures may result in further price and demand volatility.

Changes in the trade regulatory environment could weaken Brookwood�s competitive position and have a material
adverse effect on its business, net sales and profitability.  Imports of foreign-made textile and apparel products are a
significant source of competition for most sectors of the domestic textile industry. The U.S. government has attempted
to regulate the growth of certain textile and apparel imports through tariffs and bilateral agreements, which establish
quotas on imports from lesser-developed countries that historically account for significant shares of U.S. imports.
Despite these efforts, imported apparel, which represents the area of heaviest import penetration, is estimated to
represent in excess of 90% of the U.S. market.

The U.S. textile industry has been and continues to be negatively impacted by existing worldwide trade practices,
including the North American Free Trade Agreement (��NAFTA�), anti-dumping and duty enforcement activities by the
U.S. government and by the value of the U.S. dollar in relation to other currencies. The establishment of the World
Trade Organization (��WTO�) in 1995 has resulted in the phase out of quotas on textiles and apparel, effective January 1,
2005. Notwithstanding quota elimination, China�s accession agreement for membership in the WTO provides that
WTO member countries (including the United States, Canada and European countries) may re-impose quotas on
specific categories of products in the event it is determined that imports from China have surged and are threatening to
create a market disruption for such categories of products. During 2005, the United States and China agreed to a new
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quota arrangement, which imposed quotas on certain textile products through the end of 2008. The industry is
monitoring Chinese imports and continues to explore all current trade remedy laws that will address unfair trade
practices that China has failed to eliminate under its WTO commitment. The United States may also unilaterally
impose additional duties in response to a particular product being imported (from China or other countries) in such
increased quantities as to cause (or threaten) serious damage to the relevant domestic industry (generally known as
�anti-dumping� actions). In addition, China has imposed an export tax on all
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textile products manufactured in China; Brookwood does not believe this tax will have a material impact on its
business.

Under NAFTA there are no textile and apparel quotas between the U.S. and either Mexico or Canada for products that
meet certain origin criteria. Tariffs among the three countries are either already zero or are being phased out. Also, the
WTO recently phased out textile and apparel quotas.

The U.S. government has also approved the Central American Free Trade Agreement (�CAFTA�) with several Central
American countries (Costa Rica, the Dominican Republic, El Salvador, Guatemala, Honduras and Nicaragua). Under
CAFTA, textile and apparel originating from CAFTA countries will be duty and quota-free, provided that yarn formed
in the United States or other CAFTA countries is used to produce the fabric. In addition, the United States recently
implemented bilateral free trade agreements with Bahrain, Chile, Israel, Jordan, Morocco and Singapore. Although
these actions have the effect of exposing Brookwood�s market to the lower price structures of the other countries and,
therefore, continuing to increase competitive pressures, management is not able to predict their specific impact.

In 2002, the U.S. government unveiled a proposal to eliminate worldwide tariffs for manufactured goods by 2015. The
European Union has also proposed significant reductions in tariffs. These proposals have been discussed during the
ongoing WTO Doha Round of multilateral negotiations, and could lead to further significant changes in worldwide
tariffs beyond those already anticipated. A seven-year effort under the WTO Doha Round to establish further tariff
liberalization was delayed in August 2008 due to a breakdown in agricultural negotiations between developed and
emerging economies. Further Doha rounds are scheduled, however, major obstacles remain in the global trade talks
and little progress is expected in the near term. Accordingly, Brookwood believes it must fully utilize other
competitive strategies to replace sales lost to importers. One strategy is to identify new market niches. In addition to
its existing products and proprietary technologies, Brookwood has been developing advanced breathable, waterproof
laminate and other materials, which have been well received by its customers. Continued development of these fabrics
for military, industrial and consumer application is a key element of Brookwood�s business plan

The U.S. government is engaged in discussions with a number of countries or trading blocs with the intent of further
liberalizing trade. Authority to negotiate new �fast track� agreements has been granted by Congress, making new
agreements in this field more likely. The U.S. government has also entered into a free trade agreement with Australia,
Bahrain, Chile, Israel, Jordan, Morocco and Singapore.

Any employee slowdown or strike or the failure to renew the collective bargaining agreement could disrupt
Brookwood�s business.  Although, on February 28, 2010, Kenyon reached agreement for a new three-year collective
bargaining agreement with Local 1321T of the New England Joint Board of UNITE HERE! union, representing
approximately 250 employees at its Rhode Island plant facility, effective from March 1, 2010 through February 28,
2013, any employee slowdown or strike or failure to renew the collective bargaining agreement in 2013 could
adversely affect Brookwood�s operations.

Brookwood�s success is dependent upon retaining key management personnel whose continued service is not
guaranteed.  Brookwood is dependent upon its executive officers for strategic business direction and specialized
industry experience. While the Company believes that it could find replacements for these key personnel, the loss of
their services could adversely affect Brookwood�s operations.

Risks Related to our Energy Business

Risk factors for the Company�s energy business are not provided as the Company�s involvement in the energy business
ceased in 2009 following the bankruptcy reorganization of its former energy affiliate, Hallwood Energy. On
October 16, 2009, the Bankruptcy Court confirmed a plan of reorganization of the debtors that, among other things,

Edgar Filing: Hallwood Group Inc - Form 10-K

Table of Contents 20



extinguished Hallwood Energy�s general partnership and limited partnership interests, including those held by the
Company.

Item 1B. Unresolved Staff Comments

None.
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Item 2.  Properties

Real Properties

The general character, location and nature of the significant real properties owned by the Company and its subsidiaries
and the encumbrances against such properties are described below.

Cost of real estate owned by property type and location as of December 31, 2009 (in thousands):

Property Type Location Cost

Dyeing and finishing plant (Kenyon) Rhode Island $ 7,478
Parking Lot Texas 46

Total $ 7,524

As of December 31, 2009, the dyeing and finishing plant constituted less than 10% of the Company�s consolidated
assets.

Kenyon textile products� dyeing and finishing plant is a multi-shift facility well-suited for that particular business. The
development of new products requires the plant to be constantly upgraded, along with various levels of utilization. As
the Brookwood capital stock is pledged as collateral under Brookwood�s Working Capital Revolving Credit Facility
with Key Bank, the plant is indirectly encumbered. In addition, the Working Capital Revolving Credit Facility also
contains a covenant to reasonably maintain property and equipment.

Leased Facilities

The Company has a lease obligation for office space in Dallas, Texas, which expires in November 2015 and includes a
one-time option for the Company to terminate the lease in November 2012. Since January 2005, the Company shares
its Dallas office space with Hallwood Investments Limited (�HIL�), a corporation associated with Mr. Anthony J.
Gumbiner, the Company�s chairman, chief executive officer and principal stockholder, and certain of HIL�s affiliates.
In addition, from August 2005 until July 2009, the Company shared its Dallas office space with Hallwood Energy.
HIL reimburses the Company and Hallwood Energy, until July 2009, reimbursed the Company for a pro-rata share of
their lease and other office-related costs. Hallwood Energy completed its move from the office space by July 31, 2009
and no longer shares such expenses.

Brookwood leases office space for its corporate headquarters in New York City, which expires in August 2016.
Brookwood also leases an apartment in New York City to be used by company employees traveling on business. The
lease became effective in May 2009 and expires in May 2011. It has a one-year renewal option.

In January 2006, Brookwood Laminating entered into a lease for a new facility in Plainfield, Connecticut, which
original lease term was scheduled to expire in December 2010. The lease contained two five-year renewal options and
a purchase option for $3,200,000. Brookwood�s First Performance Fabric and Brookwood Roll Goods divisions share a
portion of the Connecticut facility.
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In October 2009, Brookwood Laminating notified the landlord that it was exercising its option for the purchase of its
Connecticut production facility. Brookwood anticipates completing the purchase of the facility in the 2010 second
quarter for $3,200,000, and anticipates partial financing with a $2,240,000 mortgage loan.

Brookwood Roll Goods, a division of Brookwood, leases warehouse space in Gardena, California, which expires in
April 2012.

Item 3. Legal Proceedings

Litigation.  From time to time, the Company, its subsidiaries, certain of its affiliates and others have been named as
defendants in lawsuits relating to various transactions in which it or its affiliated entities participated. Although the
Company does not believe that the results of any of these matters are likely to have a material adverse effect on its
financial condition, results of operations or cash flows, it is possible that any of the matters could result in material
liability to the Company. In addition, the Company has spent and will likely continue to spend significant amounts in
professional fees in connection with these matters.
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On July 31, 2007, Nextec Applications, Inc. filed Nextec Applications, Inc. v. Brookwood Companies Incorporated
and The Hallwood Group Incorporated in the United States District Court for the Southern District of New York
(SDNY No. CV 07-6901) claiming that the defendants infringed five United States patents pertaining to
internally-coated webs: U.S. Patent No. 5,418,051; 5,856,245; 5,869,172; 6,071,602 and 6,129,978. On October 3,
2007, the U.S. District Court dismissed The Hallwood Group Incorporated from the lawsuit. Brookwood timely
answered the lawsuit. Nextec sought leave of Court to add two additional patents to the lawsuit: U.S. Patent
No. 5,954,902 and 6,289,841. The Court granted leave to Nextec, and Nextec filed its amended complaint on
September 19, 2008. The Court conducted a hearing on February 17, 2010 to hear argument on motions for summary
judgment filed by both parties on various issues and defenses. No ruling has yet been issued following the hearing.
Brookwood intends to vigorously defend against these claims. Brookwood believes it possesses valid defenses,
however due to the nature of litigation, the ultimate outcome of this case is indeterminable at this time.

In April 2009, a claim was filed against, but not served on, the Company, each of its directors and Hallwood Financial
Limited in the state district court in Dallas County, Texas by a purported stockholder of the Company on behalf of the
stockholders of the Company other than Hallwood Financial Limited. The plaintiff alleged that in connection with the
announcement by Hallwood Financial Limited that it intended to commence an offer to acquire the remaining
outstanding shares of the Company�s common stock not beneficially owned by Hallwood Financial Limited, each of
the directors breached their fiduciary duties to the minority stockholders, and that the Company and Hallwood
Financial Limited aided and abetted that breach. The plaintiff also sought to enjoin the proposed offer. The case is
styled as Gottlieb v. The Hallwood Group, Inc., et al, No. 9-05042, 134th Judicial District, Dallas County, Texas. The
Company believes the claim is without merit. On June 17, 2009, Hallwood Financial Limited announced that it had
determined that it would not proceed with the offer.

Hallwood Energy.  On March 1, 2009, Hallwood Energy, HEM (the general partner of Hallwood Energy) and
Hallwood Energy�s subsidiaries, filed petitions for relief under Chapter 11 of the United States Bankruptcy Code. The
cases were adjucated in the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Northern District of Texas, Dallas Division, in In
re Hallwood Energy, L.P., etal Case No. 09-31253. The Company was only an investor in and creditor of Hallwood
Energy. The bankruptcy filing did not include the Company or any other of its assets.

On October 16, 2009, the Bankruptcy Court confirmed a plan of reorganization of the debtors that, among other
things, extinguished Hallwood Energy�s general partnership and limited partnership interests, including those held by
the Company. In addition, Hallwood Energy�s convertible notes, including those held by the Company, are
subordinated to recovery in favor of HPI. As a result of these developments, the Company does not anticipate that it
will recover any of its investments in Hallwood Energy. The carrying value of the Company�s investment in Hallwood
Energy has been reflected as zero since December 31, 2007.

The confirmed plan of reorganization in the Hallwood Energy bankruptcy proceeding also provides that a creditors�
trust created by the plan will pursue various claims against the Company, its officers, directors and affiliates and
Hallwood Energy�s officers and directors, including claims assigned to the creditors� trust by HPI.

In connection with an Acquisition and Farmout Agreement entered into between Hallwood Energy and FEI Shale,
L.P. (�FEI�), a subsidiary of Talisman Energy, Inc., in June 2008, the Company and Hallwood Energy entered into an
Equity Support Agreement dated June 9, 2008, under which the Company agreed, under certain conditions, to
contribute to Hallwood Energy up to $12,500,000, in consideration for which the Company would receive equity or
debt securities of Hallwood Energy. As of February 25, 2009 the Company had contributed $9,300,000 to Hallwood
Energy pursuant to the Equity Support Agreement. On that date, Hallwood Energy demanded that the Company fund
the additional $3,200,000, which the Company has not done. On March 30, 2009, Hallwood Energy filed an adversary
proceeding against the Company seeking a judgment for the additional $3,200,000. The case was originally styled as
Hallwood Energy, L.P. v. The Hallwood Group Incorporated, Adversary No. 09-03082, and is pending in the United
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States Bankruptcy Court for the Northern District of Texas, Dallas Division.

HPI and FEI intervened in the lawsuit and filed their respective complaints in intervention. Among the arguments
advanced in the complaints in intervention is that the Company�s failure to fund $3,200,000 under the Equity Support
Agreement damaged Hallwood Energy in an amount in excess of $3,200,000. In their most recent amended complaint,
HPI and the trustee for the creditors� trust contend that the additional damage is at least $20,000,000 because they
allege that the failure of the Company to fund the $3,200,000 caused FEI to not fund
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$20,000,000 due under the Farmout Agreement between Hallwood Energy and FEI. HPI and the trustee also assert
that the Company is liable for exemplary damages of $100,000,000 on account of its failure to fund the last
$3,200,000 under the Equity Support Agreement. Finally, in the second amended complaint, HPI and the trustee had
named as additional defendants Hallwood Family (BVI) L.P., Hallwood Investments Limited, Hallwood Company
Limited, the Hallwood Trust, Hallwood Financial Limited and Brookwood Companies Incorporated contending that
the additional defendants are liable to the plaintiffs under the remedy of substantive consolidation. FEI�s complaint in
intervention claims that it was denied the benefit of its bargain promised in the Farmout Agreement and alleges
consequential damages in excess of the $3,200,000. In light of the new theories advanced in HPI and the trustee�s
second amended complaint, the adversary proceeding is now styled as Ray Balestri, Trustee of the Hallwood Energy I
Creditors� Trust, as successor in interest to Hallwood Energy, L.P., Plaintiffs and FEI Shale L.P. and Hall
Phoenix/Inwood LTD., Plaintiffs in Intervention vs. The Hallwood Group Incorporated; Hallwood Family (BVI) L.P.;
Hallwood Investments Limited; Hallwood Company Limited; The Hallwood Trust; Hallwood Financial Limited; and
Brookwood Companies Incorporated, Defendants; Adversary No. 09-03082-SGJ.

On August 3, 2009, the Company was served with a complaint in Hall Phoenix/Inwood Ltd. and Hall Performance
Energy Partners 4, Ltd. v. The Hallwood Group Incorporated, et al. filed in the 298th District of Texas, No. 09-09551.
The other defendants include Anthony J. Gumbiner, the Chairman and Chief Executive Officer of the Company, Bill
Guzzetti, the President of the Company, certain affiliates of Mr. Gumbiner and certain officers of Hallwood Energy.
The complaint alleges that the defendants defrauded plaintiffs in connection with plaintiffs acquiring interests in and
providing loans to Hallwood Energy and seeks unspecified actual and exemplary damages.

Attorneys for HPI have also delivered a letter on behalf of HPI and certain affiliates alleging claims against the
Company and its officers, directors and affiliates and Hallwood Energy�s officers and directors for, among other
things, breach of contract, breach of fiduciary duties, neglect, negligence, and various alleged misleading statements,
omissions and misrepresentations. HPI and certain of its affiliates have asserted that its damages exceed
$200,000,000. The Company believes that the allegations and claims are without merit and intends to defend the
lawsuit and any future claims vigorously.

Claim Filed by Company with Insurance Carrier for Directors� and Officers� Liability Insurance Policy.  The Company
has incurred significant legal fees in connection with these actions. The Company has filed a claim with the carrier for
a directors� and officers� liability insurance policy maintained by the Company. The Company�s insurance carrier has
indicated that it will reimburse the Company pursuant to the terms of its directors� and officers� liability insurance
policy for a portion of these expenses, subject to a reservation of rights, but the Company has not yet received any
reimbursement and the extent of any reimbursement is uncertain.

Environmental Contingencies.  A number of jurisdictions in which the Company or its subsidiaries operate have
adopted laws and regulations relating to environmental matters. Such laws and regulations may require the Company
to secure governmental permits and approvals and undertake measures to comply therewith. Compliance with the
requirements imposed may be time-consuming and cost
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